

THE HONORABLE JOHN C. COUGHENOUR

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
WESTERN DISTRICT OF WASHINGTON

TIFFANY HILL and MICHELLE ANDERSON,
individually and on behalf of all others
similarly situated,

Plaintiffs,

v.

CONTINUUM GLOBAL SOLUTIONS, LLC, a
Delaware Limited Liability Company, XEROX
BUSINESS SERVICES, LLC, a Delaware Limited
Liability Company, LIVEBRIDGE, INC., an
Oregon Corporation, AFFILIATED COMPUTER
SERVICES, INC., a Delaware Corporation,
AFFILIATED COMPUTER SERVICES, LLC, a
Delaware Limited Liability Company,

Defendants.

NO. 2:12-cv-00717-JCC

**DECLARATION OF DANIEL F. JOHNSON
IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFFS' MOTION
FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES, COSTS AND
CLASS REPRESENTATIVE AWARDS**

I, Daniel F. Johnson, declare as follows:

Background and experience.

1. I am a member of the law firm of Breskin Johnson & Townsend, PLLC, counsel of record for plaintiff in this matter. I am admitted to practice before this Court and am a member in good standing of the bar of the state of Washington. I respectfully submit this declaration in support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Class Representative Awards.

1 Except as otherwise noted, I have personal knowledge of the facts set forth in this declaration
2 and could testify competently to them if called upon to do so.

3 2. Breskin Johnson & Townsend, PLLC is a law firm in Seattle, Washington, that
4 focuses primarily on plaintiffs' employment litigation. The firm currently includes three lawyers,
5 two paralegals, and an office manager.

6 3. I have practiced civil litigation in Washington for over twenty-five years, and
7 have tried numerous cases to verdict, with several multi-million-dollar judgments. I have also
8 been admitted in federal courts in New Jersey and California; and in the Ninth Circuit, Third
9 Circuit, and United States Supreme Court. I received a law degree from the University of
10 California, Berkeley, Boalt Hall School of Law in 1997. I was a law clerk to two federal district
11 judges in this district—Carolyn R. Dimmick and Robert S. Lasnik—and have been consistently
12 recognized as a "Super Lawyer" in this legal community for many years. I am a board member
13 and currently the Treasurer of the Washington Employment Lawyers Association (WELA), and
14 co-chair its Amicus Committee. I co-founded Breskin Johnson & Townsend in 2007.

15 **Qualifications of other Breskin Johnson & Townsend attorneys and paralegals.**

16 4. Erin M. Pettigrew was an associate at Breskin Johnson & Townsend, PLLC from
17 2013 to 2018. She received her law degree from the University of Washington in 2012 with a
18 Public Service Concentration in Equity in Employment. She has been a member of the Oregon
19 state bar since October 2012, and the Washington state bar since 2013, and was admitted to
20 the United States Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit.

21 5. Immediately after graduating from law school, Ms. Pettigrew accepted a
22 fellowship from the Initiative for Public Interest Law at Yale to serve low-income, immigrant
23 workers in wage disputes. In 2010, she received the Laurel Rubin Farm Worker Justice
24 Fellowship, where Ms. Pettigrew worked with legal services lawyers on a range of cases
25 involving state and federal laws protecting low-wage workers, especially agricultural workers.
26

1 She has been appointed class counsel in other cases, and has tried employment cases to
2 verdict, including in this district.

3 6. Nerissa Tigner has approximately 19 years of civil litigation experience as a legal
4 assistant and paralegal. She attended Whatcom Community College from January 1996 to
5 March 1997 for Paralegal Studies. Ms. Tigner worked with the Washington Attorney General's
6 Office from 2006 to 2018, where she served in various roles including Legal Assistant 4
7 (Supervisor) and Paralegal 2 across multiple divisions. She has provided litigation support in
8 state and federal trial and appellate courts, organized and managed document production, and
9 supervised legal support staff. Ms. Tigner joined Breskin Johnson & Townsend in December
10 2018.

11 7. Jesica Brewer (formerly Jesica McClure) earned an Associate of Technical Arts in
12 Paralegal Studies from an ABA-approved program and a Bachelor of Science degree. She has
13 over 23 years of experience as a civil litigation legal assistant/paralegal and has been employed
14 at Breskin Johnson & Townsend for approximately 5 years. Ms. Brewer has performed
15 substantive pre-trial work, trial preparation, and in-trial support in State and Federal Courts in
16 Washington for dozens of cases.

17 **Other cases litigated by BJT.**

18 8. Examples of recent wage and hour class and collective actions that Breskin
19 Johnson & Townsend has litigated to successful completion include:

20 a. *McFarland v. Evergreen Hospital Medical Center* 16-2-27488-9 SEA - Filed
21 in 2016 on behalf of hospital employees alleging wage and hour violations. BJT was
22 appointed Class Counsel and tried this case to verdict in June 2022. The King County
23 Superior Court granted final approval of a \$16.5 million settlement in 2024.

24 b. *Callister et al. v. Swedish Health Services*, No. 21-2-16148-7 SEA – On
25 behalf of hospital employees alleging wage and hour violations. BJT was appointed Co-
26 Class Counsel and obtained summary judgment for the class in 2024.

c. *Gutierrez v. E&E Foods*, No. 2:21-cv-00682 (W.D. Wash. 2020) – On behalf of about 100 fishermen for unpaid wages. BJT was appointed Co-Class Counsel and reached a class settlement in 2022.

d. *Hernandez v. Great Western Pacific*, No. 18-2-08788-1 SEA – On behalf of a class of hundreds of restaurant workers for wage and break violations. BJT was appointed Co-Class Counsel and obtained a settlement of \$1.8 million for the class.

e. *Hill v. Garda CL NW*, No. 09-2-07360-1 SEA – Filed in 2010, this was a meal and rest break case on behalf of over 500 armored car drivers. BJT was appointed Co-Class Counsel and tried the case to verdict in 2015, reaching a \$12.5 million settlement during appeals in 2019.

The prosecution of this action.

9. Breskin Johnson & Townsend has advanced significant costs for and invested numerous hours into the investigation and prosecution of this case. We will continue to commit the time and resources necessary to litigate the case and fairly and adequately represent and protect the interests of the Settlement Classes.

10. Since the beginning of this case, Breskin Johnson & Townsend has worked with no guarantee of being compensated for its time and efforts. Payment of Breskin Johnson & Townsend's fees has always been contingent on successfully obtaining relief for the Settlement Classes. As a result, there was a substantial risk of non-payment, particularly in light of the challenges inherent in this type of case. Work on this case has necessarily been to the exclusion of work on other matters that likely would have generated fees.

11. The work performed by paralegals and legal assistants was work that I or an attorney would have had to perform absent such assistance. Specifically, Nerissa Tigner and Jesica Brewer, who each have decades of experience as paralegals in this community, performed work on this case that required an understanding of the facts and claims at issue in the case and were important to the development of those facts and claims. All of these staff

members are qualified to perform substantive legal work based on their training and experience.

12. The following table identifies the attorneys and paralegals from Breskin Johnson & Townsend who worked on this case and for whom the recovery of fees is sought. For each of the timekeepers below I have stated the current hourly rate, the number of hours worked through October 8, 2025, and the total amount of fees. These time summaries are taken from contemporaneous, daily time reports prepared and maintained by Breskin Johnson & Townsend in the regular course of business.

NAME AND POSITION	DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED	RATE	HOURS BILLED	TOTAL
ATTORNEYS				
Daniel F. Johnson J.D. from University of California, Berkeley, Boalt Hall School of Law in 1997	All aspects of litigation and appeals.	\$700	729.7	\$510,790
Erin Pettigrew J.D. from University of Washington, 2012	Support for motions and discovery.	\$500	47.3	\$23,650
PARALEGALS				
Jesica Brewer	Support all aspects of litigation.	\$250	2.5	\$625
Nerissa Tigner	Support all aspects of litigation.	\$250	13.2	\$3,300
TOTAL:			792.7	\$538,365

13. The spreadsheet attached as Exhibit A lists the time entries recorded by each timekeeper listed above, contemporaneously with performing the work, in the litigation of this case. I have removed time entries by attorneys whose total time was less than five hours.

DECLARATION OF DANIEL F. JOHNSON IN
SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFFS' MOTION FOR
ATTORNEYS' FEES, COSTS AND CLASS
REPRESENTATIVE AWARDS - 5
Case No. 2:12-cv-00717-JCC

BRESKIN | JOHNSON | TOWNSEND PLLC
600 Stewart St., Suite 901
Seattle, WA 98101 Tel: 206-652-8660

14. The firm will incur additional fees in relation to the approval and settlement administration process. Breskin Johnson & Townsend estimates it will incur an additional \$35,000 in fees to prosecute this case through final settlement approval.

15. The lodestar calculations are based on reasonable hourly rates. Breskin Johnson & Townsend counsel sets rates for attorneys and staff members based on a variety of factors, including among others: the experience, skill and sophistication required for the types of legal services typically performed; the rates customarily charged in the markets where legal services are typically performed; and the experience, reputation and ability of the attorneys and staff members.

16. Breskin Johnson & Townsend has incurred out-of-pocket litigation expenses totaling \$17,500.97, primarily to cover expenses related to filing, notice, depositions, expert fees, and legal research fees. The chart attached as Exhibit B summarizes Breskin Johnson & Townsend's litigation costs.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of Washington and the United States of America that the foregoing is true and correct.

EXECUTED this 13th day of October, 2025.

BRESKIN JOHNSON TOWNSEND, PLLC

By: s/ Daniel Johnson

Daniel F. Johnson, WSBA 27848

Attorney for Plaintiff

- Exhibit A -

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
5/9/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review potential class member communications and associated documents; Review recent caselaw on piecerate rule	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
5/10/2012	Daniel Johnson	Research case law and discuss meeting with Marshall and others	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/11/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review documents	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/14/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review documents and correspondence from potential class members	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
5/16/2012	Daniel Johnson	Meet with Marshall, MacLeod, and Cote about case and strategy	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
5/17/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with counsel	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/30/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review fee-sharing agreement and correspond with Marshall and partners about same	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/30/2012	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Marshall about status and plans; Call potential class member about eastern Washington facilities	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/3/2012	Daniel Johnson	Talk with class member Amy Fodor	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
8/16/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review documents from Amy Fodor; Conference with Marshall and Cote about clients, evidence, claims and venue	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
8/20/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise discovery letter	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/22/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with Amy Fodor and with co-counsel regarding discovery conference	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/23/2012	Daniel Johnson	E-mail about discovery conference	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/28/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss discovery plans with co-counsel; Discovery conference with opposing counsel including discussion of claims	2.4	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
8/29/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with Cote regarding discovery and class representatives	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/30/2012	Daniel Johnson	Call Amy Fodor	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
9/5/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss Discovery Plan and related issues	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/7/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise draft discovery request and correspondence about same	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
9/10/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and comment on revised joint status report	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
9/11/2012	Daniel Johnson	Discuss discovery issues with co-counsel	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
9/17/2012	Daniel Johnson	Confer about initial disclosures; Retrieve and transmit Sump protective order; Review documents from Sump and revise initial disclosures	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
9/26/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review, discuss, and revise letter to counsel about revised DRP	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
10/1/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review correspondence between counsel	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/2/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review discovery correspondence and discuss with co-counsel	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/3/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about damages estimates	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
10/8/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss correspondence from opposing counsel; Send correspondence to other potential class members	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
10/9/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review ABC plan documents and correspond with	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
10/9/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspond with potential class members and/or witnesses; Review documents from defendants; Conference with co-counsel about docs	3.1	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
10/10/2012	Daniel Johnson	Draft FLSA complaint	2.9	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
10/11/2012	Daniel Johnson	Work on federal complaint and discuss same; Research on FLSA minimum wage and overtime claims and memo regarding same; Confer with counsel re same	2.9	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
10/12/2012	Daniel Johnson	Confer with staff and review and approve documents for filing	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
10/15/2012	Daniel Johnson	Conference about hearing in Hill case and collect documents for same; Review docs	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
10/16/2012	Daniel Johnson	Attend status conference; Discuss discovery and proceedings with opposing counsel; Discuss strategy with co-counsel	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
10/17/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about scheduling order; Correspondence about time records	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/19/2012	Daniel Johnson	Research on ACS	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
10/22/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and file service of summons	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/23/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about magistrate judge	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/30/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about consolidation	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/31/2012	Daniel Johnson	Conference with all counsel; Follow-up conference with Marshall	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
11/1/2012	Daniel Johnson	E-mail to opposing counsel about time data	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
11/8/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss damages calculations; Write to opposing counsel about same	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
11/9/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review documents and outline issues for conference and for future discovery; Conference with Madden about hours and payments	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
11/12/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review WACs and outline claim for gap-time; Conference with co-counsel regarding same	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
11/13/2012	Daniel Johnson	E-mail with co-counsel about settlement preparation in Hill	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/16/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review letter from Defendant in Hill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
11/21/2012	Daniel Johnson	Discuss potential class members	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/21/2012	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with class member	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
11/26/2012	Daniel Johnson	Conference and correspondence with class member	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
11/28/2012	Daniel Johnson	Work on draft settlement proposal	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
11/29/2012	Daniel Johnson	Work on settlement offer and discuss same with co-counsel	2.3	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
11/30/2012	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft settlement demand; Correspondence with class members	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/6/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise settlement letter; Correspondence with class members; Conference about settlement	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
12/7/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review settlement offer in Hill	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/27/2012	Daniel Johnson	Review Hill settlement letter and make notes thereof	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
1/3/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review file and explain case to Donckers	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
1/4/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss summary of telephone call about settlement	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
1/10/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Madden about Sump settlement and follow up with co-counsel regarding same; Correspondence with class members	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
1/15/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss letter from Madden regarding Hill settlement data	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
1/16/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and edit Hill discovery	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
1/17/2013	Daniel Johnson	Additional edits to second discovery in Hill; Correspondence with Spokane class member	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
1/22/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with Hill and Douglas class members	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
1/29/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Cote regarding Hill settlement	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
1/30/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with Cote about preservation issues	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/31/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss status with Cote	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/1/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with class member in Hill about workplace developments; Correspondence and conference about settlement	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
2/6/2013	Daniel Johnson	Receive and organize class member documents	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/13/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with co-counsel	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/14/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with Cote about DRP	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/15/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review Hill settlement letter	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/18/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about settlement and mediation	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/19/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about scheduling	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/20/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about mediation	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/21/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with co-counsel about status conference	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/26/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about Hill settlement status and strategy	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/7/2013	Daniel Johnson	E-mail about status in Hill; Conference about strategy; Review letters and other materials related to settlement; Review docs	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
3/8/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference regarding settlement, strategy, and discovery in Hill; Correspondence about gap time claims; Revise discovery list	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
3/11/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about Hill negotiations	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/12/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss Hill settlement proposal; Review and discuss letter and new cases	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
3/13/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Cote about Hill settlement	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/15/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with Cote about Sump settlement	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
3/19/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and transmit new documents from Spokane	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/4/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss changes to proposed stipulated protective order	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/15/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review letter from opposing counsel and review cases on class certification	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
4/16/2013	Daniel Johnson	E-mail to co-counsel about strategy; Conference with CBS reporter	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
4/17/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about Hill discovery and settlement	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/19/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with co-counsel about strategy in Hill negotiations and litigation	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/22/2013	Daniel Johnson	E-mail about strategy in Hill case	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/23/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and forward new documents from Spokane; Conference with Cote	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
4/24/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about new documents in Hill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/26/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss response about Hill mediation; Call and discuss mediators	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
4/26/2013	Daniel Johnson	Call opposing counsel and check mediators	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
4/27/2013	Daniel Johnson	Hill: Schedule mediation; Review and discuss discovery responses; Review final changes to protective order	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/1/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss Hill discovery	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
5/1/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with counsel about inspection, summary judgment, mediation brief in Hill	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
5/3/2013	Daniel Johnson	Call to opposing counsel and correspondence with co-counsel in Hill; Conference with Madden about discovery responses; Summar	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
5/6/2013	Daniel Johnson	Site visit in Federal Way	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
5/7/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about class members and OTC claims; Correspondence with class members about OTC claims	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/8/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with class members	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/13/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about Hill settlement; Correspondence with and about class members and documents; Review case from Madden	1	\$700.00	\$700.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
5/14/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about mediation; Review and revise mediation letter	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
5/16/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence and conferences about mediation and about summary judgment motion	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
5/17/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about Spokane metrics	0	\$700.00	\$0.00
5/20/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss additional claim for unpaid wages	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
5/22/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss summary judgment tactics with Cote and make arrangements about mediation	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/23/2013	Daniel Johnson	Attend mediation	6	\$700.00	\$4,200.00
5/31/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss and analyze mediation bill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/3/2013	Daniel Johnson	E-mail Cote about motion	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/4/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss potential motions with Cote	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
6/11/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss discovery with Cote	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
6/13/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss document production with Cote	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/14/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review MSJ draft	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
7/11/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss discovery and related correspondence	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/12/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review motion for summary judgment	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/15/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with co-counsel; Correspondence with class member in Spokane about discovery	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
7/23/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review correspondence regarding discovery; Correspond with Spokane class member regarding job assignment	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/25/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence from Spokane class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/29/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss plaintiffs' discovery responses with Cote	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
7/31/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss discovery to plaintiffs; Conference with co-counsel about same	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/5/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss discovery with Cote and review letter to Madden about class list	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/8/2013	Daniel Johnson	Draft objection to discovery request regarding Sump documents	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/15/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss discovery and motions with co-counsel	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
8/20/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review information related to Oregon class settlement; Organize witness statements; Review and respond to e-mail from Amy Fodor	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/26/2013	Daniel Johnson	Email with Cote	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/30/2013	Daniel Johnson	Work on discovery responses	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/4/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss draft deposition notice	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/5/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss deposition with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/17/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss 30(b)(6) deposition with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/20/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss correspondence about deposition; Assist Marshall in responding to defense counsel	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
9/23/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review correspondence about depositions	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
9/24/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review agreements about depositions	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/1/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review e-mail about continued deposition; Discuss depositions and motion with co-counsel	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
10/2/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with opposing counsel about deposition	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/3/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss post-shift and follow-up claims with Cote	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/15/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss class certification motion; Review and revise same; Work on declaration	1.7	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
10/16/2013	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion and declaration; Discuss motion with Cote	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
10/17/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss deposition transcripts with co-counsel	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/22/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss motion to seal procedure with Nunn; Discuss Douglas deposition	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/25/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss motion to seal with Cote	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/28/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Cote about Hill deposition	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
11/18/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss motion to seal with co-counsel and opposing counsel	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/20/2013	Daniel Johnson	Print response brief and organize file	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
11/26/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about reply	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/1/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review class certification briefs and discuss reply with Cote	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
12/3/2013	Daniel Johnson	Conference and e-mails about motions	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/4/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss stipulation about briefing schedules; Get motion for summary judgment for review	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
12/6/2013	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss briefing on class certification and summary judgment	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
12/9/2013	Daniel Johnson	Work on class certification reply	2.5	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
12/10/2013	Daniel Johnson	Work on reply brief	2.8	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
12/11/2013	Daniel Johnson	Outline section of reply brief on class certification	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
12/12/2013	Daniel Johnson	Discuss and work on section for reply on class certification	4.3	\$700.00	\$3,010.00
12/13/2013	Daniel Johnson	Edit draft for reply brief	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/16/2013	Daniel Johnson	Work on final draft of reply brief	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
12/17/2013	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with Cote about filing	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/2/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss issues on summary judgment with Pettigrew	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
1/3/2014	Daniel Johnson	Discuss summary judgment response with Cote	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/6/2014	Daniel Johnson	Discuss summary judgment brief with Pettigrew	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
1/6/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Continue drafting response to def msj: argument regarding "piece rate systems"	2.3	\$500.00	\$1,150.00
1/6/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Review draft plf motion for summary judgment	0.4	\$500.00	\$200.00
1/6/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Legal research responding to Def argument re WMWA and calculation of minimum wage	0.5	\$500.00	\$250.00
1/6/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Additional legal research and review of cited WA Sup Court decisions in Def MSJ: Review Champagne, Inniss, SPEEA, and Weeks a	2.6	\$500.00	\$1,300.00
1/6/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Telephonic conference with Johnson and Cote regarding responding to def surreply and motion for summary judgment	0.7	\$500.00	\$350.00
1/6/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Additonal legal research for recent decisions regarding per-hour requirement under MWMA and parallel provisions	1.3	\$500.00	\$650.00
1/9/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review new case on collective action; Discuss opposition to summary judgment with Pettigrew;	0.7	\$500.00	\$350.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Mtg with Johnson to discuss legal theory and exemptions to MWMA; Add language regarding the nature of the busines model as di	0.7	\$500.00	\$350.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Outline argument and review Defendants' motion again to ensure all points are responded to; Set up pleadings and caption; Upd	1.3	\$500.00	\$650.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Legal research for "remedial statute" language; Legal resarch regarding FLSA and WMWA Summary Judgment cases and appropriate	2.8	\$500.00	\$1,400.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Read and outline Fiore and Tift	0.3	\$500.00	\$150.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Draft legal argument regarding relevant legal standards governing WMWA minimum wage actions.	0.8	\$500.00	\$400.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Draft argument section regarding Administrative provisions that require the hour-by-hour method	0.4	\$500.00	\$200.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Draft email to Cote, Johnson, and Marshall regarding focus of legal briefing	0.2	\$500.00	\$100.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Read and respond to email from Cote; review Xerox briefing for the motion to certify the class.	0.7	\$500.00	\$350.00
1/9/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Draft argument section regarding Washington and Ninth Cir. case law supporting hour-by-hour method	0.9	\$500.00	\$450.00
1/10/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Drafting legal argument section of response to motion for partial summary judgment; first round of edits and citation check	5.3	\$500.00	\$2,650.00
1/10/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Legal research regarding overtime argument and relevant CFR interpreting FLSA regulations pertaining to peicerate workers	1.3	\$500.00	\$650.00
1/11/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Examine deposition testimony available in Douglas and Hill; Review deposition testimony regarding ABC and subsidy payment cal	0.4	\$500.00	\$200.00
1/12/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Email Johnson with questions regarding Defendants and source material to offer in support of Response	0.2	\$500.00	\$100.00
1/13/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Review deposition of Cohen, Turback, and Cooper for testimony regarding the ABC compensation system; edit and revise argument	0.8	\$500.00	\$400.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
1/13/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Additional review of deposition transcripts of Cohen, Turback, and Cooper for citations regarding the nature of the ABC compe	1.9	\$500.00	\$950.00
1/13/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Drafting second version of the facts with additional citations to the record	1.1	\$500.00	\$550.00
1/13/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Send email to Johnson regarding production piece rate v. averaging rates	0.4	\$500.00	\$200.00
1/13/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Continue to review dep transcript of Cooper for additional citations to the record	0.2	\$500.00	\$100.00
1/14/2014	Daniel Johnson	Work on summary judgment response	3.8	\$700.00	\$2,660.00
1/14/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Read through deposition of Evans; Add citations to Response; Read deposition of Reid	1.8	\$500.00	\$900.00
1/14/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Discussion with Johnson regarding approach to briefing and reorganizing legal arguments.	0.4	\$500.00	\$200.00
1/15/2014	Daniel Johnson	Discuss summary judgment motion;	2.8	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Review Decl. of Marshall and motion to seal to determine which documents need to be filed under seal for Response to Motion for SJ	0.5	\$500.00	\$250.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Review discovery and depositions to add additional citations to the record in Response	2.1	\$500.00	\$1,050.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Review draft declaration of Tiffany Hill; Discuss with Johnson; Email Cote and Johnson in response	0.5	\$500.00	\$250.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Discussion with Johnson regarding utility of Fiore to discussion regarding OT violations.	0.2	\$500.00	\$100.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Discussion with Johnson regarding alternative argument offered by Xerox regarding damages provision and other workweek method	0.4	\$500.00	\$200.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Review Exhibit 6 (FEPS net payroll summary) to calculate unpaid gap time	0.1	\$500.00	\$50.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Additional review of draft Response after Johnson edits	1.9	\$500.00	\$950.00
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Discussion regarding waiver of rights and alleged harm to class members with Breskin	0.3	\$500.00	\$150.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
1/15/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Email to Johnson regarding final round of changes to response brief	0.3	\$500.00	\$150.00
1/16/2014	Daniel Johnson	Finish SJ response brief	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
1/16/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Additional final review of draft response to def motion for partial summary judgment	0.2	\$500.00	\$100.00
1/16/2014	Erin Pettigrew	TC with Cote, Johnson; later TC with Cote, Johnson and Marshall regarding response to motion for summary judgment.	0.8	\$500.00	\$400.00
1/17/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise TMD draft of MSJ response	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
1/17/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Review draft of Response from TMDW; Discuss and edit together with Johnson; Read through Johnson edits to brief	1.6	\$500.00	\$800.00
1/21/2014	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about surreply; Print same for review	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
1/22/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss surreply and motion	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
1/23/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise response to motion re substantive surreply	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
1/29/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise stipuation regarding Sump settlement	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/31/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss Buchanan declarations	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/31/2014	Erin Pettigrew	Read Defendant's Reply ISO surreply	0.2	\$500.00	\$100.00
2/3/2014	Daniel Johnson	Discuss and correspond about L&I declarations with Cote	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/5/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review stipulation about Sump settlement	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/12/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss Buchanan declaration and motion to seal and response	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
3/28/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review order sealing records	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/11/2014	Daniel Johnson	Email about order sealing documents	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/11/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss order	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
7/15/2014	Daniel Johnson	Conference with counsel	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
7/28/2014	Daniel Johnson	Listen to and discuss voicemail from Madden regarding settlement prospects	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/29/2014	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about notice to class	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/31/2014	Daniel Johnson	Discuss and research Sump settlement date issue	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
8/1/2014	Daniel Johnson	Conference about briefs; Draft brief re Sump settlement	4.3	\$700.00	\$3,010.00
8/4/2014	Daniel Johnson	Circulate sealed materials	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
9/18/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review order and discuss appeal	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/22/2014	Daniel Johnson	Discuss request for stay, and review prior pleadings	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
9/23/2014	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence and research about appeal	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
9/30/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss petition to appeal	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
10/3/2014	Daniel Johnson	Begin drafting response to motion for stay	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/6/2014	Daniel Johnson	Discuss answer to petition to appeal	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/7/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise answer to petition for interlocutory review	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
10/8/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and comment on final draft of answer to petition to appeal	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/9/2014	Daniel Johnson	Revise draft response to motion to stay	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
10/13/2014	Daniel Johnson	Email about response to motion to stay	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/13/2014	Daniel Johnson	Finish response to motion to stay	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/17/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review reply on motion for stay and discuss with co-counsel	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/20/2014	Daniel Johnson	Email about motion to stay	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/22/2014	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion for leave to reply	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
12/3/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss order in Ninth Circuit and question about moving to certify to state supreme court	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/16/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review mediation questionnaire	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/29/2014	Daniel Johnson	Email with Cote about motion to certify	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
12/31/2014	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise motion to certify to state court	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
1/6/2015	Daniel Johnson	Work on and discuss motion to certify	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
1/7/2015	Daniel Johnson	Conference about motion to certify	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
1/15/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review mediation order and past mediation materials and discuss same with co-counsel	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
2/2/2015	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with co-counsel	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/3/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review response brief from Xerox; Discuss reply and begin working on outline; Begin drafting reply	4.2	\$700.00	\$2,940.00
2/4/2015	Daniel Johnson	Discussions with mediator and Cote	4.1	\$700.00	\$2,870.00
2/5/2015	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft of reply brief	3.7	\$700.00	\$2,590.00
2/9/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss reply brief with opposing counsel and file same; Correspondence about settlement proposals	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
2/10/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review damages numbers and discuss settlement offer with co-counsel	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
2/11/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss settlement proposal	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/20/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review appeal brief	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
4/21/2015	Daniel Johnson	Discuss appeal brief with co-counsel	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/8/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise appeal brief	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
5/12/2015	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Cote about appeal brief	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
7/15/2015	Daniel Johnson	Disucss parallel case with Cote	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/12/2015	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise notice of supplemental authority	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/21/2015	Erin Pettigrew	Initial assingment of research project	0.2	\$500.00	\$100.00
8/24/2015	Erin Pettigrew	Legal research	2.5	\$500.00	\$1,250.00
8/25/2015	Erin Pettigrew	Legal research on reply brief	2.7	\$500.00	\$1,350.00
9/1/2015	Erin Pettigrew	Legal research in support of reply brief	2.8	\$500.00	\$1,400.00
6/1/2016	Daniel Johnson	Email about new case and draft letter giving notice of intent to include current employees in certified class	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
6/9/2016	Daniel Johnson	Letter to counsel about NLRA and scope of class	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
8/15/2016	Daniel Johnson	Discuss possible new claim for damages regarding rest breaks	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/10/2016	Daniel Johnson	Update class member records	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/6/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review 28j letter from Xerox and discuss same	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/9/2017	Daniel Johnson	Draft response to 28j letter	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
1/11/2017	Daniel Johnson	Finalize response to supplemental authority	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/18/2017	Daniel Johnson	Check oral argument panel and schedule moot court	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/23/2017	Daniel Johnson	Discuss moot court with Cote	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/25/2017	Daniel Johnson	Discuss and schedule moot court	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/30/2017	Daniel Johnson	Prepare for and attend moot court	2.4	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
2/2/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review new case at Supreme Court	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/3/2017	Daniel Johnson	Moot court with co-counsel	2.9	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
2/6/2017	Daniel Johnson	Email about hearing change	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/7/2017	Daniel Johnson	Attend oral argument	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
2/7/2017	Erin Pettigrew	Observe oral arguments	0.3	\$500.00	\$150.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
2/14/2017	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with co-counsel about supplemental authority	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/7/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss order certifying question	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
8/14/2017	Daniel Johnson	Discuss certification and review appeal brief	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/16/2017	Daniel Johnson	Discuss appeal with WELA and with Marshall; Transmit documents to WELA	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
8/22/2017	Daniel Johnson	Email and conference regarding briefing schedule	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/30/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review and approve Ninth Circuit Report; Email with WELA about amici	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/31/2017	Daniel Johnson	Send briefing to WELA	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
9/12/2017	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with and about class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
9/26/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review certification and briefing from Dovex	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
9/27/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review Dovex briefs	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
10/3/2017	Daniel Johnson	Send materials to WELA and discuss with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/4/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review brief to supreme court	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
10/5/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review Xerox brief and discuss with Marshall	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
10/11/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/16/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs and outline issues for response	3.2	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
10/17/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review prior briefing for answering brief	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
10/18/2017	Daniel Johnson	Finish reviewing briefs and begin resarch and outlining Answer	2.5	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
10/20/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review Dovex briefing for material in answer; Discuss outline with Marshall	1.7	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
10/21/2017	Daniel Johnson	Begin assembling and drafting answering brief	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
10/22/2017	Daniel Johnson	Continue assembling answering brief	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
10/23/2017	Daniel Johnson	Drafting Answering Brief	1.8	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
10/24/2017	Daniel Johnson	Work on answering brief and discuss arguments with Marshall	4.3	\$700.00	\$3,010.00
10/25/2017	Daniel Johnson	Work on answering brief	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
10/26/2017	Daniel Johnson	Finish first draft of answering brief	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
11/1/2017	Daniel Johnson	Discuss, review, and revise answering brief	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
11/2/2017	Daniel Johnson	Work on answering brief	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
11/3/2017	Daniel Johnson	Finish second draft of answering brief	3.4	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
11/6/2017	Daniel Johnson	Finish Answering Brief	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
11/9/2017	Daniel Johnson	Review email from Ms. Hill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/17/2018	Daniel Johnson	Meeting with Wage Claim Project about amicus	1.4	\$700.00	\$980.00
1/18/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs and email with amicus	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
1/23/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review and comment on WWCP amicus brief	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
1/28/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review and suggest revisions to amicus brief	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
2/27/2018	Daniel Johnson	Response to WWCP amicus brief	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/1/2018	Daniel Johnson	Set up moot court	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/8/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss letter from Court	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
3/12/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs and attend moot court	3.6	\$700.00	\$2,520.00
3/15/2018	Daniel Johnson	Travel and attend oral argument at Supreme Court	5.5	\$700.00	\$3,850.00
5/22/2018	Daniel Johnson	Research on Xerox transfer	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/19/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review Supreme Court decision and discuss same; Conference with Marshall about next steps; Email with opposing counsel about same	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
10/1/2018	Daniel Johnson	Email and call Nunn about defendant name change	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/4/2018	Daniel Johnson	Email about name change	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/7/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review cost bills and applicable rule	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/26/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review file and draft stipulation	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
10/29/2018	Daniel Johnson	Draft stipulation	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
11/1/2018	Daniel Johnson	Email opposing counsel about report to court	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
11/7/2018	Daniel Johnson	Email Nunn about report again	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
11/9/2018	Daniel Johnson	Draft edits to Xerox proposal for joint statement	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
11/12/2018	Daniel Johnson	Email to Marshall about status and strategy; Argue with Nunn and Madden about joint report	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/13/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss latest proposed joint statement; Draft Appellee statement	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
11/14/2018	Daniel Johnson	File report in Ninth Circuit; Review Xerox's report	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
11/29/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review panel on appeal and email with Marshall about letter briefs	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/17/2018	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about letter brief	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
12/19/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise letter brief	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
12/27/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review letter briefs	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
12/28/2018	Daniel Johnson	Review new filings	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
5/13/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discuss status report with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/11/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review court order and discuss with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/12/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss cost bill	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/17/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review files on mediation and value of claims	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
6/18/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review damages calculations and recreate same	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
6/19/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review orders and briefing and send summary of status and plans to Marshall	1.7	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
6/20/2019	Daniel Johnson	Confer with Marshall; Review and analyze discovery responses and compare with ER 408 damages information; Write to opposing c	2.5	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
6/21/2019	Daniel Johnson	Examine discovery	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/25/2019	Nerissa Tigner	Analyzed defendant document production to determine whether uploading to discovery database is beneficial.	0.5	\$250.00	\$125.00
6/25/2019	Daniel Johnson	Research lifting of stay and write to Nunn about same	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
6/26/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and compile ABC plan documents; Collect and organize depositions	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
6/27/2019	Daniel Johnson	Reveiw depositions	1.7	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
6/28/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review depositions	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
6/28/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review depositions; Review discovery and correspondence about same	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
7/2/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review discovery requests and outline new discovery	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
7/3/2019	Daniel Johnson	Continue reviewing discovery and drafting new; Email to Nunn about mandate	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
7/8/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review depositions	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/9/2019	Daniel Johnson	Work on discovery requests; Review DRP; Conference with Marshall on discovery and class definition; Email with Nunn and draft	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
7/10/2019	Daniel Johnson	Work on stipulation and amended complaint	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
7/11/2019	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence about stipulation; Begin motions	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
7/12/2019	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
7/13/2019	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion; Email to Nunn about stay and Marshall about discovery; Draft new discovery	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
7/16/2019	Daniel Johnson	Draft motion on scope of class; Call Nunn and write to court about stay; Finalize discovery and discuss with staff and Marsha	2.9	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
7/17/2019	Daniel Johnson	Work on motions and discovery	2.2	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
7/17/2019	Nerissa Tigner	Drafted declaration and proposed order in support of motion to define scope of class.	0.5	\$250.00	\$125.00
7/20/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discuss JSR conference	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/22/2019	Daniel Johnson	Set conferences with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/24/2019	Daniel Johnson	Conferences with Marshall and with opposing counsel about discovery, motions, and JSR	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
7/25/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discuss and finalize motion regarding interrogatories	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
7/26/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss proposed JSR and draft response	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
7/29/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review JSR	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/30/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review, research, and outline issues from Defendants' JSR	2.9	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
7/31/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about issues and arguments	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/5/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review responses on motions and outline replies	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
8/6/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about reply briefs; Research on delegation, estoppel, and class arbitration; Conference with Marshall ab	2.6	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
8/7/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and analyze class member data for DRP issue; Draft reply on interrogatories	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
8/8/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discuss notice of withdrawal with Marshall; Draft reply on interrogatories	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
8/8/2019	Nerissa Tigner	Researched class member data in defendant document productions.	0.7	\$250.00	\$175.00
8/9/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss edits to reply brief on interrogatories; Finish and file same	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
8/12/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review notice of surreply	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
8/12/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss order; Review and discuss pending discovery	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
8/16/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review discovery responses and write to paralegal about class data	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
8/20/2019	Nerissa Tigner	Reviewed defendant document production for class info and pay data; 4 Uploaded defendant document production to Eclipse and tag		\$250.00	\$1,000.00
8/22/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discuss class data with paralegal	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/28/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss discovery responses from Defendant	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
8/29/2019	Daniel Johnson	Scheduling discovery conference	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/30/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss Marshall's summary of damages data	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
9/3/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss discovery requests and strategy for same	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/4/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discovery conference	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
9/13/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise summary of conferenc to OC and proposed class notice and discuss same with Marshall	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/18/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss email from opposing counsel about discovery and class	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/23/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review class list and email with Nunn about contact information; Conference with Munson and email to Munson about engagement;	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
9/24/2019	Daniel Johnson	Attend joint status report; Meet with opposing counsel; Draft proposed order; Discuss same with opposing counsel; Email about same	2.3	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
9/25/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and approve JSR; Email with class notice administrators	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
9/25/2019	Daniel Johnson	Proposal to notice admin	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
9/30/2019	Daniel Johnson	Notice administrator proposal	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/4/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review, revise, and discuss notice with defense counsel	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
10/9/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about notice	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/10/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email with opposing counsel and expert about damages data etc.: Email with Marshall about same	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
10/11/2019	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Marshall and review documents and notice	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
10/12/2019	Daniel Johnson	Follow up with Marshall about notice	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/18/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss email regarding form of notice; Accept changes and respond; Send same to administrator	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
10/24/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss class list and notice to class; Email to counsel and to administrator regarding same	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
10/25/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discuss notice and administration with JND	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
10/28/2019	Daniel Johnson	Draft motion on notice plan	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
10/29/2019	Daniel Johnson	Add details to class notice	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
11/1/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/6/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review email correspondence about class and notice	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
11/7/2019	Daniel Johnson	Finalize and send stipulation	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/13/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review and finalize stipulated motion on notice and declaration for same; Email with Marshall about same	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
11/14/2019	Daniel Johnson	Draft order on notice plan and send to opposing counsel	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/15/2019	Daniel Johnson	Update notice plan and order; Contact JND about schedule	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
11/27/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email opposing counsel about damages data	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/6/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email about class data; Email court about notice	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/9/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email about class data; Analyze new data	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/10/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email Marshall about class data; Email Munson	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/11/2019	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Marshall and with Munson about damages data	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/13/2019	Daniel Johnson	Collect materials for briefing on liability	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/15/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review orders on liability	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
12/16/2019	Daniel Johnson	Continue reviewing briefs and orders; Conference with Marshall about damages formula; Outline SJ	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
12/17/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email about notice plan and class list	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/18/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review supreme court briefs; Email with Marshall about class list	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
12/19/2019	Daniel Johnson	Discuss class list with Marshall	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
12/20/2019	Daniel Johnson	Review SJ briefing	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
12/30/2019	Daniel Johnson	Email about notice administration	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
1/2/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about status of damages calculations and about notice plan	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about motions and damages calculations and review same	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
1/10/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss damages calculations with Marshall; Discuss motions, expert report, and pre-trial calendar	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
1/13/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review, revise, and discuss draft expert report	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
1/14/2020	Daniel Johnson	Conference with expert	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
1/16/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall regarding damages report	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/20/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review data and drafts	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/21/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss defense expert report	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
1/22/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about skip traces	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/23/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with JND about skip tracing	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
1/24/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about damages calculations and about skip tracing	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/27/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review prior SJ briefing and get evidence of record compiled	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
1/28/2020	Daniel Johnson	Start motion for SJ	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
1/29/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion for summary judgment	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
1/30/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion for summary judgment; Email about SSNs for notice	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
1/31/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on summary judgment motion; Email about stipulation and SSNs for class notice	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
2/4/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email court about stipulation	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/5/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion for summary judgment	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
2/6/2020	Daniel Johnson	Cost bill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review status of notice; Discuss double damages claim and discovery with Marshall	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
2/10/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion for summary judgment	1.4	\$700.00	\$980.00
2/11/2020	Daniel Johnson	Research and respond to emails from possible class member	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
2/12/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email Marshall about double damages arguments; Work on summary judgment motion; Email with Marshall about same	2.6	\$700.00	\$1,820.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
2/13/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft of motion for summary judgment	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
2/14/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review report from JND and send Munson bill for payment;Conference with Marshall about experts and summary judgment	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
2/14/2020	Daniel Johnson	Gather deposition transcripts	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/18/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email Marshall about double damages discovery	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/19/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about discovery requests with Marshall	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
2/25/2020	Daniel Johnson	Discuss Boedeker report and arbitration issue; Review and accept edits to MSJ; Research litigation waiver and discuss same with Marshall	2.5	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
2/26/2020	Daniel Johnson	Research and summarize litigation waiver issues; Review rebuttal report; Conference with Marshall about arbitration and rebut	4.4	\$700.00	\$3,080.00
2/27/2020	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Munson	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
3/2/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss JND declaration	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/3/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about status	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/4/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about JND declaration and Tysheka Richard	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/6/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review motion to compel arbitration and collect and begin reviewing cases; Assign Stolt-Neilsen research to law clerk	3.4	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
3/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Continue research on arbitration waiver; Email about MSJ and expert	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
3/9/2020	Daniel Johnson	Further research for motion to compel arbitration; Conference with Marshall about experts, discovery, and motions	3.1	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
3/10/2020	Daniel Johnson	Research on waiver of arbitration	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
3/11/2020	Daniel Johnson	Continue research on arbitration; Finalize and send draft motion for summary judgment; Review and discuss second amended expe	2.8	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
3/12/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finalize and file motion for summary judgment; Work on response to motion to compel arbitration	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
3/13/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel	3.4	\$700.00	\$2,380.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
3/14/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel; Email about office closures and motion schedules	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
3/15/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
3/16/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel arbitration; Conference with Marshall about scheduling; Conference with all counsel about same	4.3	\$700.00	\$3,010.00
3/16/2020	Nerissa Tigner	Legal research	5	\$250.00	\$1,250.00
3/17/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel; Review and discuss responses to Requests for Admission; Review and discuss scheduling plan	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
3/17/2020	Nerissa Tigner	Legal research	2.5	\$250.00	\$625.00
3/17/2020	Daniel Johnson	Research on prejudice and futility	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
3/18/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
3/18/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response brief	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
3/19/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about and work on stipulation	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
3/23/2020	Daniel Johnson	Discuss e-service agreement; Work on response to motion to compel	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
3/24/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
3/25/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel; Email with co-counsel about withdrawals	2.6	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
3/26/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to compel	3.6	\$700.00	\$2,520.00
3/27/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about briefing schedules; Work on response to motion to compel	2.4	\$700.00	\$1,680.00
3/30/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response brief	3.1	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
3/31/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response brief	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
4/1/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft response; Email with and about Munson	3.5	\$700.00	\$2,450.00
4/2/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review Amedee matter	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
4/3/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about motion response	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/6/2020	Daniel Johnson	Discuss response to motion to compel and work on revisions;	4	\$700.00	\$2,800.00
4/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email Marshall about response brief	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
4/8/2020	Daniel Johnson	Final revisions to response on motion to compel	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
4/9/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finish brief, declaration, and order on motion to compel; Review second rebuttal reprt from Defendants' expert	2.6	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
4/10/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review and direct payment of costs; Discuss Boedeker report with Marshall	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
4/13/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review response and cross motion	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
4/14/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review and outline issues in Response and cross motion	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
4/15/2020	Daniel Johnson	Research legal issues and discuss response and cross motion with Marshall	3.7	\$700.00	\$2,590.00
4/16/2020	Daniel Johnson	Research on res judicata	2.3	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
4/17/2020	Daniel Johnson	More research on res judicata	2.6	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
4/20/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with paralegal	2.2	\$700.00	\$1,540.00
4/21/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response and reply brief	2.5	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
4/22/2020	Daniel Johnson	Drafting response and reply on summary judgment	2.3	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
4/23/2020	Daniel Johnson	Drafting response and reply	1.8	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
4/24/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response and reply	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
4/27/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on double damages issue	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
4/28/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response and reply brief	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
4/29/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft sections of response and reply brief; Review and research motion to decertify	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
4/30/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft of response and reply	5.6	\$700.00	\$3,920.00
5/1/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finish response and reply and supporting documents	5.3	\$700.00	\$3,710.00
5/4/2020	Daniel Johnson	Discuss motion to decertify	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
5/5/2020	Daniel Johnson	Research and outline response to motion to decertify	2.8	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
5/6/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to decertify	2.7	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
5/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to decertify	3.2	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
5/8/2020	Daniel Johnson	Draft response to motion to decertify	6.2	\$700.00	\$4,340.00
5/9/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review reply on cross motion for summary judgment	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
5/11/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finiah response to motion to decertify	5.1	\$700.00	\$3,570.00
5/22/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/6/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review proposed joint motion and order and email Marshall about same	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about stipulation	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
8/28/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss order on decertification and arbitration	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
9/25/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member; Review notice of appeal; Discuss request for 1 stay	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
9/28/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review schedule; Discuss status and plans with Marshall; Respond to opposing counsel about stay; Draft supplemental declaration regarding damages	5.1	\$700.00	\$3,570.00
9/30/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review surreply by defendants	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/2/2020	Daniel Johnson	Discuss filings with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/5/2020	Daniel Johnson	Work on response to motion to stay	3.4	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
10/6/2020	Daniel Johnson	Continue working on response to motion for stay	3.8	\$700.00	\$2,660.00
10/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft of response to motion to stay	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
10/8/2020	Daniel Johnson	Edits to response to motion to stay	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
10/9/2020	Daniel Johnson	Final edits to response	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/11/2020	Daniel Johnson	Final review of response to motion to stay	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
10/13/2020	Daniel Johnson	Send brief for filing	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/21/2020	Daniel Johnson	Respond to class member inquiry	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
11/23/2020	Daniel Johnson	Discuss mediation conference with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
11/30/2020	Daniel Johnson	Discuss settlement offer with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/1/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email with circuit mediator	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/3/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review SJ pleadings	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/4/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs and calculations and email Marshall about settlement offer	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
12/7/2020	Daniel Johnson	Draft settlement offer	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
12/14/2020	Daniel Johnson	Email about settlement offer	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/21/2020	Daniel Johnson	Review appeal schedule	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/25/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
2/4/2021	Daniel Johnson	Get brief and discuss plan	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/9/2021	Daniel Johnson	Collect materials for appeal	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
2/11/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss appeal brief	2.7	\$700.00	\$1,890.00
2/12/2021	Daniel Johnson	Collect cases and excerpts; Assign research to law clerk	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
2/13/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review cases for appeal	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
2/15/2021	Daniel Johnson	Research for appeal	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
2/16/2021	Daniel Johnson	Research for appeal	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
2/17/2021	Daniel Johnson	Discuss appeal with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/19/2021	Daniel Johnson	Outline appeal issues	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
2/20/2021	Daniel Johnson	Work on outline of appeal brief	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
2/22/2021	Daniel Johnson	Discuss, research, and outline appeal brief	4.7	\$700.00	\$3,290.00
2/23/2021	Daniel Johnson	Research for appeal	2.9	\$700.00	\$2,030.00
2/25/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review FRAPs and discuss extension	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/28/2021	Daniel Johnson	Research for appeal	2.5	\$700.00	\$1,750.00
3/1/2021	Daniel Johnson	Extension of time	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/5/2021	Daniel Johnson	Work on appeal brief	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
3/7/2021	Daniel Johnson	Begin drafting appeal brief	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
3/12/2021	Daniel Johnson	Work on appeal brief	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
3/13/2021	Daniel Johnson	Draft appeal brief	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
3/15/2021	Daniel Johnson	Drafting appeal brief	2.6	\$700.00	\$1,820.00
3/16/2021	Daniel Johnson	Working on appeal brief	6.9	\$700.00	\$4,830.00
3/17/2021	Daniel Johnson	Finish drafting appeal brief	4.1	\$700.00	\$2,870.00
3/18/2021	Daniel Johnson	Discuss new Excerpts of Record; Final edits to draft brief and send to Marshall	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
3/28/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review email about sealed exhibits	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/29/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review and work on citations in brief	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
3/30/2021	Daniel Johnson	Final edits and instructions on brief to paralegal	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
4/1/2021	Daniel Johnson	Work on cites with Jesica	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
4/2/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about filing brief	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/4/2021	Daniel Johnson	Finalize brief, tables, and excerpts of record	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
3/18/2021	Jesica McClure	Research regarding filing supplemental excerpts of record under seal; research regarding supplemental excerpt of record as cited in Hill brief	2	\$250.00	\$500.00
4/14/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review calendars and email about oral argument	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/11/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/12/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email JND about class list	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/31/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/1/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email about oral argument	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
7/19/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review email from clerk and check calendar; Write to clerk	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/28/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review court calendar and reply brief	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
7/29/2021	Daniel Johnson	Collect briefs and cases and begin review for appeal and begin reviewing briefs	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
7/30/2021	Daniel Johnson	Finish reviewing briefs and start reviewing cases; Discuss moot court	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
8/2/2021	Daniel Johnson	Research for argument and discuss moot	1.4	\$700.00	\$980.00
8/3/2021	Daniel Johnson	Research for oral argument	4.6	\$700.00	\$3,220.00
8/4/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review evidence and continue researching and outlining argument	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/5/2021	Daniel Johnson	Oral argument preparation	1.9	\$700.00	\$1,330.00
8/6/2021	Daniel Johnson	Prepare for oral argument	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
8/10/2021	Daniel Johnson	Prepare for moot court	3.9	\$700.00	\$2,730.00
8/11/2021	Daniel Johnson	Work on argument outline	3.9	\$700.00	\$2,730.00
8/12/2021	Daniel Johnson	Prepare for and attend oral argument	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
9/7/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss order on motion for stay	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/20/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
10/8/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review response to motion to stay	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
11/17/2021	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss stay order and order regarding Morgan v. Sundance	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
12/2/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about stay	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
12/15/2021	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/18/2022	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss petition in Sundance	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
2/21/2022	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/20/2022	Daniel Johnson	Email from class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
5/5/2022	Daniel Johnson	Correspondence with class member	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/23/2022	Daniel Johnson	Review Sundance decision and send to Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/30/2022	Daniel Johnson	Discuss order from court and collect cases and briefs	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
7/4/2022	Daniel Johnson	Review Sundance case and briefs on appeal	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
7/5/2022	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs on appeal; Research on forfeiture	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
7/6/2022	Daniel Johnson	Review notes from oral argument	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
7/7/2022	Daniel Johnson	Review cases on waiver	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
7/8/2022	Daniel Johnson	Research on waiver	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
7/11/2022	Daniel Johnson	Email about appeal	0	\$700.00	\$0.00
7/12/2022	Daniel Johnson	Discuss supplemental brief with Marshall	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
7/13/2022	Daniel Johnson	Work on supplemental brief	2.3	\$700.00	\$1,610.00
1/4/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email co-counsel	1.7	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
1/9/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review appellate rules	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/5/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review court of appeals decision	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
2/3/2023	Daniel Johnson	Discuss appellate decision	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
2/6/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss appellate decision	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
2/13/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review file	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
2/14/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member; Draft settlement letter	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
2/15/2023	Daniel Johnson	Finalize settlement letter	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/17/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review cost bill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/20/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review petition for rehearing and Rule 35	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
2/27/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs on appeal	1.4	\$700.00	\$980.00
2/28/2023	Daniel Johnson	Collect materials for review and drafting response to motion for rehearing	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
3/1/2023	Daniel Johnson	Work on response brief	3.1	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
3/2/2023	Daniel Johnson	Work on response brief	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
3/6/2023	Daniel Johnson	Respond to class member inquiry; Work on response brief	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
3/7/2023	Daniel Johnson	Research on waiver;	3.1	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
3/8/2023	Daniel Johnson	Drafting response brief	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
3/9/2023	Daniel Johnson	Work on response brief	4.6	\$700.00	\$3,220.00
3/10/2023	Daniel Johnson	Finish draft response brief	4	\$700.00	\$2,800.00
3/16/2023	Daniel Johnson	Finalize response brief	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
4/12/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review motions and caselaw; Discuss docket, pending motions, and updating court	1.8	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
4/13/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/1/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review docket and email co-counsel	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/2/2023	Daniel Johnson	Call court and relay status to Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/21/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/21/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
8/21/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email about class member inquiry	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/28/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss court order and review pleadings on SJ	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
9/19/2023	Daniel Johnson	Write to opposing counsel	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
9/22/2023	Daniel Johnson	Review briefs on SJ and shepardize significant cases and issues	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
9/28/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email with opposing counsel	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/29/2023	Daniel Johnson	Prepare JSR for filing	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
10/12/2023	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/27/2023	Daniel Johnson	Discuss defendant party status	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
12/28/2023	Daniel Johnson	Discuss UCCS with Lopez	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/17/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall and call court about status of motions	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
1/25/2024	Daniel Johnson	Call court and write to Marshall about status	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/13/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss court order	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
2/14/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss issues for reconsideration	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
2/16/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review research from Lopez; Collect cases	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
2/17/2024	Daniel Johnson	Research res judicata for motion for reconsideration	3.8	\$700.00	\$2,660.00
2/18/2024	Daniel Johnson	Research and outline motion for reconsideration	3	\$700.00	\$2,100.00
2/19/2024	Daniel Johnson	Research and outline motion for reconsideration	3.6	\$700.00	\$2,520.00
2/20/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss motion for reconsideration	1.6	\$700.00	\$1,120.00
2/21/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss class notice issue with Lopez; Discuss motion for reconsideration with Marshall and Heidelberg	1.8	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
2/22/2024	Daniel Johnson	Work on motion	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/24/2024	Daniel Johnson	Drafting motion for reconsideration	4	\$700.00	\$2,800.00
2/25/2024	Daniel Johnson	Drafting and editing motion for reconsideration	3.8	\$700.00	\$2,660.00
2/26/2024	Daniel Johnson	Edits to motion for reconsideration; Draft motion for other relief	3.6	\$700.00	\$2,520.00
2/27/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss final edits to motions for relief	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
2/28/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review court order and discuss plan with Marshall; Conference with all 1 counsel about court order and JSR		\$700.00	\$700.00
3/8/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall and with class member about motions	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/11/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss draft JSR	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
3/12/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss edits to JSR	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
3/13/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss JSR with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
3/14/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email about JSR	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/28/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review minute order on motion for reconsideration	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/9/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/11/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review response to motion	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
4/12/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss response and reply with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/13/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and research on response to motion for reconsideration	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
4/14/2024	Daniel Johnson	Research for reply brief	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
4/15/2024	Daniel Johnson	Continue research	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
4/16/2024	Daniel Johnson	Work on reply brief	3.7	\$700.00	\$2,590.00
4/17/2024	Daniel Johnson	Work on draft reply	3.3	\$700.00	\$2,310.00
4/18/2024	Daniel Johnson	Revise and discuss reply brief and finalize same with declaration for filing	2.8	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
4/19/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss notice of surreply	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
4/29/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email class member; Review surreply	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/21/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Ms. Hill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
5/23/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/11/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and analyze order on reconsideration	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
6/12/2024	Daniel Johnson	Share order with class member; Discuss status with Marshall	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
6/14/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Munson	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
6/18/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about offsets	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/19/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email opposing counsel about offsets	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/20/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Ms. Hill	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/24/2024	Daniel Johnson	Meet with Munson about offsets and removal of class members	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
6/28/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email Marshall about offsets	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
7/9/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall about status and review other pay analysis	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
7/10/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review legal research and email with Marshall about same	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
7/11/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Marshall regarding damages calculations	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
7/15/2024	Daniel Johnson	Stipulation	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/16/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Nunn	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/18/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email about case schedule	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/19/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email about trial schedule	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/22/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with class members; Research class member appeal and discuss with Marshall	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
7/23/2024	Daniel Johnson	Call with Michelle Anderson	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
7/25/2024	Daniel Johnson	Fee agreement for Ms. Anderson and email to Marshall	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
7/26/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Ms. Hill and with Marshall about Anderson agreement	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/28/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with class member	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/29/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review Marshall analysis	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/31/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss pay type analysis	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
8/1/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss Mashall notes and pay data issues with Marshall and Munson	3.1	\$700.00	\$2,170.00
8/2/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review notes on offsets	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
8/3/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Munson	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
8/14/2024	Daniel Johnson	Talk with Munson about status	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/19/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/21/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and notate draft updated Munson report	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
8/22/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review, analyze, edit, and discuss revised expert report	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
8/23/2024	Daniel Johnson	Work on edits to Munson update	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
8/26/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Marshall; Meeting with expert	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
8/29/2024	Daniel Johnson	Meet with Munson	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
8/30/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss draft expert report	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
9/5/2024	Daniel Johnson	Text Munson	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
9/9/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss expert report	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
9/10/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review Boedecker report	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
9/11/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email Marshall and review Boedecker report	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
9/12/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review Boedeker declaration and documents cited therein	3.2	\$700.00	\$2,240.00
9/13/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss expert reports with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
9/17/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conferences with Munson	3.1	\$700.00	\$2,170.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
9/18/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Munson	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
9/20/2024	Daniel Johnson	Talk with Munson	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
10/4/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Marshall and Munson	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
10/7/2024	Daniel Johnson	Conference with Munson and Marshall; Review order regarding double damages in light of Androckitis	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
10/8/2024	Daniel Johnson	Meeting with Munson and Marshall	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
10/9/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review final report and discuss with Munson	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
10/15/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss schedule with Marshall	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
10/23/2024	Daniel Johnson	Discuss objections to amended report from Munson	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
12/18/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email about status	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
12/19/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review schedule; Discuss expert depositions and plan for motions	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
12/26/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and log Munson deposition	2	\$700.00	\$1,400.00
12/24/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review Munson deposition	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
12/23/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review Munson deposition	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
12/27/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review and log Munson deposition and send same to Marshall	1.8	\$700.00	\$1,260.00
12/29/2024	Daniel Johnson	Log Boedecker deposition	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
12/28/2024	Daniel Johnson	Review Boedecker deposition	2.8	\$700.00	\$1,960.00
12/30/2024	Daniel Johnson	Email with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/5/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss MSJ	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
1/4/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review MSJ	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
1/6/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss MSJ with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/8/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise Daubert motion	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
1/9/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss edits to Daubert motion	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
1/10/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise final versions of motions	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
1/14/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and research motion to exclude and for summary judgment	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
1/15/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss ADR deadline and motion response with Marshall; Investigate mediation options	1.2	\$700.00	\$840.00
1/16/2025	Daniel Johnson	Draft email to opposing counsel about mediation	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/22/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review, revise, and discuss response brief	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
1/23/2025	Daniel Johnson	Email about mediation	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
1/23/2025	Jesica McClure	Draft stipulation and proposed order regarding extending ADR Deadline	0.5	\$250.00	\$125.00
1/24/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review new filings	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
1/28/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss response to motion for summary judgment	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
1/29/2025	Daniel Johnson	Outline responses to motion for summary judgment	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
1/30/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise draft MSJ reply	1	\$700.00	\$700.00
1/31/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise reply on Boedecker	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
2/7/2025	Daniel Johnson	Contact mediator	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/10/2025	Daniel Johnson	Email about mediation	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
2/11/2025	Daniel Johnson	Compile records for mediation	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/18/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review files and discuss mediation with Marshall	3.5	\$700.00	\$2,450.00
2/19/2025	Daniel Johnson	Work on mediation statement	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00
2/20/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review minute order	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
2/21/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss minute order with Marshall; Review defendant's mediation statement	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
2/25/2025	Daniel Johnson	Email with JDR and with Marshall about calculations	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
2/26/2025	Daniel Johnson	Attend mediation	3.8	\$700.00	\$2,660.00
2/27/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss supplemental brief	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
3/3/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review defendant's supplemental brief	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
3/21/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss order on summary judgment	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
3/24/2025	Daniel Johnson	Text Munson; Discuss new damages assessments and settlement potential with Marshall; Email Kallas and plan conference	1.7	\$700.00	\$1,190.00
3/26/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review court order again	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
3/27/2025	Daniel Johnson	Call with mediator	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
3/28/2025	Daniel Johnson	Meet with Munson	1.5	\$700.00	\$1,050.00
3/29/2025	Daniel Johnson	Conference with mediator	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
3/30/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss settlement figures	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
4/1/2025	Daniel Johnson	Meeting with Munson	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
4/3/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review, revise, and discuss Revised Munson Report	2.1	\$700.00	\$1,470.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
4/4/2025	Daniel Johnson	Conference with mediator and with Marshall	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
4/7/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review final mediator's proposal	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
4/8/2025	Daniel Johnson	Email class representative and review proposed stipulation; Conference with Ms. Anderson	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/6/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise and discuss proposed settlement agreement	0.9	\$700.00	\$630.00
5/11/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss settlement agreement	0.7	\$700.00	\$490.00
5/12/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss settlement agreement	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/13/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss allocations of settlement money	1.1	\$700.00	\$770.00
5/15/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review bids for administration	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/19/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review draft notice; Complete amended complaint and discuss with Marshall; Review calculations;	1.3	\$700.00	\$910.00
5/20/2025	Daniel Johnson	Finalize amended complaint and notice; Discuss terms with Marshall	3.4	\$700.00	\$2,380.00
5/21/2025	Daniel Johnson	Finalize and send settlement docs and edits to defense; Discuss admin bids	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
5/22/2025	Daniel Johnson	Declaration in support of preliminary approval; Review admin bids	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/23/2025	Daniel Johnson	Analyze bids	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/27/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss admin	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
5/28/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss edits to settlement agreement	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00
5/29/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review edits to settlement	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
5/30/2025	Daniel Johnson	Send declaration to Ms. Anderson; Review and revise motion for preliminary approval	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
6/2/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
6/3/2025	Daniel Johnson	Work on proposed order	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
6/4/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss motion	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/6/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss disagreements about settlement terms	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00
6/9/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss scope of release	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
6/10/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss defense edits to notice and motion	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
6/16/2025	Daniel Johnson	Email about status	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
6/17/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review motion and declaration	0.4	\$700.00	\$280.00

Date	User	Narrative	Units	Price	Value
6/23/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss edits to settlement	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/14/2025	Daniel Johnson	Email Anderson and sign settlement agreement	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
7/2/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss final terms of settlement with Marshall	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
7/29/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss preliminary approval	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/1/2025	Daniel Johnson	Email with CPT about notice and settlement process	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/7/2025	Daniel Johnson	Work on timeline of settlement	0.6	\$700.00	\$420.00
8/11/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss and review settlement timeline	0.1	\$700.00	\$70.00
8/12/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss class award calculations	0.3	\$700.00	\$210.00
8/13/2025	Daniel Johnson	Discuss tax treatment and notice allocations with Marshall	0.2	\$700.00	\$140.00
8/14/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss final notice	0.8	\$700.00	\$560.00
8/15/2025	Daniel Johnson	Review and discuss additional changes to class notice	0.5	\$700.00	\$350.00